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Shirley and Abe, a retired couple from New York City, 
living in Miami Beach, are getting ready to go out to 
dinner. 

Shirley says, "Abe, darling, do you want me to wear this 
Chanel suit or the Gucci?" 

Abe says, "Do I care?" 

A few minutes later Shirley says, "Abe, should I wear my 
Cartier watch or my Rolex?" 

Abe says, "Who cares?" 

A few more minutes pass and Shirley says, "Abe, love, 
shall I wear my five-carat pear diamond ring or my six-
carat round diamond ring with the baguettes?" 

Abe says, "Shirley, I really don't care what you wear, but 
if you don't get moving, we're going to miss the Early 
Bird Special." 

 

 

 

 

As I pulled into the parking lot at the department store, 
I noticed a car with its headlights on. I jotted down the 

make, color and license number. Inside the store I 
joined the line at the information desk. 

When the clerk reached me, I told her a white Ford in 
the parking lot had its lights on and gave her the 
number. 

"Thank you," she replied, and went on to another 
customer. 

The lady next to me asked her indignantly, "Aren't you 
going to announce it?" 

"There's no need," she replied sheepishly. "That car 
belongs to me." 

 

 

"Hello, hello?" shrilled a spinsterish voice over the 
phone. "Is this the SPCA?" 

"Yes." 

"I want you to send somebody over right away." 

"What's wrong?" 

"There's a horrid magazine salesman sitting in a tree 
teasing my dog." 

 

 

One evening a man was very impressed with the meat 
entree his wife had served. "What did you marinate this 
in?" he asked. 

His wife immediately went into a long explanation 
about how much she loved him and how life wouldn't 
be the same without him, etc. 

Eventually, his puzzled expression made her interrupt 
her answer with a question of her own, "What did you 
ask me?" 

She chuckled at his answer and explained, "I thought 
you asked me if I would marry you again!" 



As she left the room, he called out, "Well, would you 
marry me again?" 

Without hesitation, she said, "Vinegar and barbecue 
sauce." 

 

 

 

 

 

A boy was taking care of his baby sister while his 
parents went to town shopping.  He decided to go 
fishing and he had to take her along. 

"I'll never do that again!" he told his mother that 
evening.  "I didn't catch a thing!" 

"Oh, next time I'm sure she'll be quiet and not scare the 
fish away," his mother said. 

The boy said, "It wasn't that.  She ate all the bait. 

 

 

I took my mother on a fishing excursion yesterday. 
Nobody was having any luck. After drifting for hours 
without so much as a nibble, who should hook into one 
but my Mom. Everyone on the boat was excited,  
cheering the old woman on and telling her to take her 
time. 

Finally she lifted the fish into the boat, picked it up, 
removed the hook, looked at it up and down, and then 
tossed it back into the water. 

I was stunned. I said, "Mom, why did you throw that 
fish back into the water?" 

"I don't know. To me it just didn't look fresh." 

 

 

*GOLF, n.* 

GOLF, n. 

a game that consists of a lot of walking, broken up by 
disappointment and bad arithmetic. 

a game of opposites - the world's slowest people are 
ahead of you, and the fastest are behind. 

a colorful sport that keeps you on the green, in the pink, 
and financially in the red. 

a game which is allowed to be played on Sunday (under 
blue laws) because it was not considered a game by the 
law, but a form of moral effort. 

a game a lot like taxation - you drive hard to get to the 
green, and then you find yourself in a hole. 

  

GOLF CART, n. 

A popular mode of transportation because, unlike a 
caddie, it can neither count, criticize, nor snicker. 

  

GOLFER, n. 

a person who yells "fore," takes six, and puts down five; 

a guy who has the advantage over a fisherman - he 
doesn't have to bring home anything when he brags he 
had a great day. 

 

 

At day care, a four-year-old watched as a teacher pulled 
something hot from the oven. 

"What's that on your hand?" he asked. 

"An oven mitt," she said. "It keeps me from getting 
burned. Doesn't your mother use them? 

"No, my mom's just really careful when she opens the 
pizza box." 

 



 

Volume 12 Number 19 “A sense of humor keeps life interesting…” –Marjorie Pay Hinckley May 12 2013 

   

The day I immigrated to the United States, I was given 
an alien ID card that featured a cute photo of me at age 
15. Years later, when I went to the courthouse to 
become a citizen, a clerk confiscated my card. 

"What will you do with it?" my wife asked. 

"We burn it" was the answer. 

"Could you please cut the photo off and let us keep it?" 
asked my wife. 

"Certainly not," said the clerk. "This card is official U.S. 
government property. As such it cannot be mutilated 
before it's destroyed." 

 

 

 

 

 

John was a construction foreman. One day he tumbled 
from a scaffold, managing to break his fall by grabbing 
on to parts of the scaffold on the way down. He 
received only minor scratches. 

Embarrassed by the fall, he climbed back up to continue 
working. Then he noticed his co-workers holding up 
hastily-made signs reading, 9.6, 9.8, and 9.4. 

 

I accompanied my husband when he went to get a 
haircut. Reading a magazine, I found a hairstyle I liked 
for myself, and I asked the receptionist if I could take 
the magazine next door to make a copy of the photo. 

"Leave some ID, a driver's license or a credit card," she 
said. 

"But my husband is here getting a haircut," I explained. 

"Yes," she replied. "But I need something you'll come 
back for." 

 

 

After raising 4 children, and losing my husband, I 
decided to return to college and get the degree I had 
started, but never finished. And so, on my first day of 
college, eager with anticipation, and more than a little 
nervous, I took a front row seat in my first class in over 
40 years, a literature course. 

The professor told us we would be responsible for 
reading five books over the course of the semester, and 
that he would provide us with a list of authors from 
which we could choose. 

He ambled over to the lectern, took out his class book, 
and began "Baker, Black, Brooks, Carter, Cook..." 

I was working feverishly to get down all the names, 
when I felt a tap on my shoulder. 

The student behind me whispered, "Slow down! He's 
just taking attendance!" 

 

 

I accompanied my husband when he went to get a 
haircut. Reading a magazine, I found a hairstyle I liked 
for myself, and I asked the receptionist if I could take 
the magazine next door to make a copy of the photo. 

"Leave some ID, a driver's license or a credit card," she 
said. 



"But my husband is here getting a haircut," I explained. 

"Yes," she replied. "But I need something you'll come 
back for." 

 

 

 

 

 

I heard recently about a stay-at-home Mom. One  
evening she went to a PTA meeting and her husband  
and her oldest daughter got together and decided  
they would clean up the kitchen for her. 

They put away all the food, wiped all the  
counters, washed all the pots and put them away,  
put the dishes in the dishwasher and ran it. They  
swept and mopped the floors and then sat down, 
awaiting her arrival. 

Two hours later she returned from the meeting,  
took off her coat, hung it up, walked through the  
kitchen into the den, grabbed the remote control,  
and began watching television. They followed her  
over to her chair and stood by her side. 

Finally she felt them looking over her shoulder  
and looked up at them and said, "What?"• 

Her husband said, "The kitchen." 

"The kitchen. What?" 

"The kitchen. We cleaned up the kitchen. Didn't  
you notice? It's sparkling clean. We cleaned it for you."• 

The woman replied, "Yes, I noticed. Thankless job, isn't 
it? 

 

 

An elderly gentleman checked into a New York hotel. 
The clerk mentioned the phone service the 
establishment made available for calling guests who 
wished to rise at an early hour. 

"No need for that, young man," snapped the old timer. 
"I always wake up at five A.M. sharp without an alarm 
clock." 

"Very good, sir," the clerk replied, then asked, "Would 
you mind calling me at six?" 

 

 

There was an unexpected knock on my door, and like I 
always do I first opened the peephole and asked, 
"Who's there?" 

"Parcel Post, ma'am. I have a package that needs a 
signature." 

"Where's the package?" I asked suspiciously. The 
deliveryman held it up. 

"Could I see some ID?" I said, still not convinced. 

"Lady," he replied wearily, "if I wanted to break into 
your house, I'd probably just use these." And he pulled 
out the keys I had left in the door. 

 

 

Our pastor, an avid golfer, was once taking part in a 
local tournament. As he was preparing to tee off, the 
organizer of the tournament approached him and 
pointed to the dark, threatening storm clouds which 
were gathering. 

"Preacher," the organizer said, "I trust you'll see to it 
that the weather won't turn bad on us." 

Our pastor shook his head. "Sorry," he replied. "I'm 
sales, not management! 

 

Our family, like a lot of busy families, eats out often. 
When grandma was visiting, she decided to make a 
special, home-cooked dinner and asked the five-year-
old grandson, "What's your favorite thing to have for 
supper?" 
 
"At what restaurant, Grandma?" he asked. 
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The minister gave his Sunday morning service, as usual, 
but this particular Sunday, it was considerably longer 
than normal.  

Later, at the door, shaking hands with parishioners as 
they moved out, one man said, "Your sermon, Pastor, 
was simply wonderful - so invigorating and inspiring and 
refreshing." 

The minister of course, broke out in a big smile, only to 
hear the man say, "Why I felt like a new man when I 
woke up!" 

 

 

 

Record High Temperatures in Salt Lake this week! 

 

 

Both of my parents work and lead very hectic lives. So 
my father was bound to forget their wedding 
anniversary. 

Remembering at the last minute, he sped to the 
stationery store, flew through the door, and 
breathlessly asked the salesclerk, "Where are the 
anniversary cards?" 

To his surprise, he heard my mother call out, "Over 
here, Bill." 

A man was on his way home with a new car, which was 
absorbing all his attention, when it struck him that he 
had forgotten something.  

Twice he stopped, counted his parcels, searched his 
pockets, but finally decided he had everything with 
him.  Yet the feeling persisted. 

When he reached home his daughter ran out, stopped 
short, and cried: 

"Daddy, where's Mommy?" 

 

 

Our power went out during a severe windstorm and the 
smoke alarm started to beep. The noise was so 
annoying I just couldn't stand it. Home alone, I climbed 
up on a chair and using a kitchen knife, I took the alarm 
apart. Very pleased with myself, I was puzzled to hear 
the annoying beeping again.  

When my husband came home, I explained this  
strange situation. He looked at the wall, then back to 
me and said, "Well, I don't know about the smoke 
alarm, but you've managed to take the doorbell apart." 

 

 

When my daughter-in-law and I caught only one perch 
on our fishing trip ... not enough for even a modest 
lunch ... we decided to feed it to her two cats. 

She put our catch in their dish and watched as the two 
pampered pets sniffed at the fish but refused to eat it. 

Thinking quickly, my daughter-in-law then picked up the 
dish, walked over to the electric can opener, ran it for a 
few seconds, then put the fish back down. 

The cats dug right in. 

 

 



A young man, fresh out of college, went to see his 
doctor one day.  

"Doc, there's something wrong with me.  Every time I 
stand in a baby's high chair and face southwest, and 
then touch my tongue to a piece of aluminum foil that's 
wrapped around an acorn, I get a strange tingle in my 
big toe.  Can you tell me what the problem is?" 

"Sure!" The doctor said.  

"You have way too much time on your hands!" 

 

 

 

 

 

To keep their active two-year-old from roaming onto 
the busy street in front of their home, my sister and 
brother-in-law decided to put a gate across the 
driveway. 

After working over two weekends on the project, the 
dad was ready to attach the lock to complete the job. 
He was working on the yard side of the gate, with his 
daughter nearby, when he dropped the screwdriver he 
was using and it rolled under the gate, out of his reach. 

"I'll get it, Daddy," the little girl called, nimbly crawling 
under the newly erected barrier. 

 

 

Government Pipe Specifications  

1.  All pipe is to be made of a long hole, surrounded by 
metal or plastic centered around the hole. 

2.  All pipe is to be hollow throughout the entire length - 
do not use holes of different length than the pipe. 

3.  The I.D.  (inside diameter) of all pipe must not 
exceed the O.D.  (outside diameter) - otherwise the hole 
will be on the outside. 

4.  All pipe is to be supplied with nothing in the hole so 
that water, steam or other stuff can be put inside at a 
later date. 

5.  All pipe should be supplied without rust - this can be 
more readily applied at the job site. N.B.  Some Vendors 
are now able to supply pre-rusted pipe.  If available in 
your area, this product is recommended as it will save a 
lot of time on the job site. 

6.  All pipe over 500 ft (153m) in length should have the 
words "long pipe" clearly painted on each end, so the 
Contractor will know it is a long pipe. 

7.  Pipe over 2 miles (3.2 km) in length must have the 
words "very long pipe" painted in the middle, so the 
Contractor will not have to walk the entire length of the 
pipe to determine whether or not it is a long pipe or a 
very long pipe. 

8.  All pipe over 6" (152 mm) in diameter must have the 
words "large pipe" painted on it, so the Contractor will 
not mistake it for small pipe. 

9.  Flanges must be used on all pipe.  Flanges must have 
holes for bolts quite separate from the big hole in the 
middle. 

10.  When ordering 90 degrees, 45 degrees or 30 
degrees elbow, be sure to specify right hand or left 
hand; otherwise you will end up going the wrong way. 

11.  Be sure to specify to your vendor whether you want 
level, uphill or downhill pipe.  If you use downhill pipe 
for going uphill, the water will flow the wrong way. 

12.  All couplings should have either right hand or left 
hand thread, but do not mix the threads - otherwise, as 
the coupling is being screwed on one pipe, it is 
unscrewed from the other. 

 

 

Freelance newspaper writers don't get nearly as much 
attention as writers with regular bylines. So I was 
delighted when I finally got some notice. It was at the 
bank, and I was depositing a stack of checks. 

"Wow," said the teller, reading off the names of 
publishers from the tops of the checks. "You must 
deliver a lot of papers." 

 

 

If a man speaks in the forest and no one hears him, is he 
still wrong? 



 

Volume 12 Number 21 “A sense of humor keeps life interesting…” –Marjorie Pay Hinckley May 26, 2013 

   

A college professor asked his class a question. 

"If Philadelphia is 100 miles from New York and Chicago 
is 1000 miles from Philadelphia and Los Angles is 2000 
miles from Chicago, how old am I?" 

One student in the back of the class raised his hand and 
when Called upon said, "Professor you're 44.." 

The Professor said, "You're absolutely correct, but tell 
me, how did you arrive at the answer so quickly?" 

The student said, "You see professor, I have a brother; 
he's 22, and he's only half crazy." 

 

 

 

There’s a lesson to be learned here. 

 

 

Most of us have a bad habit we are constantly trying to 
break. For me, it's biting my fingernails. One day I told 
my husband about my latest solution: press-on nails. 

"Great idea, Honey," he smiled. "Now you can eat them 
straight out of the box." 

 

A counselor was helping his kids put their stuff away on 
their first morning in Summer Camp. 

He was surprised to see one of the youngsters had an 
umbrella. 

The counselor asked, "Why did you bring!  an umbrella 
to camp?" 

The kid answered, "Did you ever have a mother? 

 

 

As a history buff, I was looking forward to staying in a 
hotel in Salisbury, England. This hotel dated back to the 
13th century. 

When I arrived, the hotel clerk gave me some bad news 
-- my room was in the new section. 

Disappointed, I asked when the "new" section had been 
built. 

"In the 1600's," she replied apologetically. 

 

 

Bob had finally made it to the last round of the $50,000 
Question.  The night before the big question, he told the 
host MC that he desired a question on American 
History. 

The big night arrived.  Bob made his way onstage in 
front of the studio and TV audience.  He had become 
the talk of the week.  He was the best guest this show 
had ever seen.  The MC stepped up to the mike. 

"Bob, you have chosen American History as your final 
question.  You know that if you correctly answer this 
question, you will walk away $50,000 dollars richer.  Are 
you ready?" 

Bob nodded with a cocky confidence -- the crowd went 
nuts. He hadn't missed a question all week. 

"Bob, yours is a two-part question. As you know, you 
may answer either part first.  As a rule, the second half 



of the question is always easier. Which part would you 
like to take a stab at first?" 

Bob was becoming more noticeably nervous. He 
couldn't believe it, but he was not sure, but American 
History was his easiest subject, and he played it safe. 

"I'll try the easier part first." 

The MC nodded approvingly. "Here we go Bob. I will ask 
you the second half first, then the first half." 

The audience grew silent with gross anticipation... 

"Bob, here is your question: And in what year did it 
happen?" 

 

 

 

 

 

My father's method of accounting for the hundreds of 
cattle on his ranch was very unique. 

Every spring, he would move the herd down a long 
ramp, through a wooden gate and into a holding pen for 
inspection. As each animal entered the pen, he marked 
the count on the gate. 

One summer, he went to the bank to apply for a loan, 
using his cattle for collateral. The bank officer asked to 
see his records. 

"No problem," replied Dad. He went back to the ranch, 
took the gate off its hinges and brought it to the bank.  

He got the loan. 

 

 

After watching the movie Cinderella, five-year-old Sarah 
started using her pinwheel as a magic wand, pretending 
she was a fairy godmother.  "Make three wishes," she 
told her mother, "and I'll grant them." 

Her mom first asked for world peace.  Sarah swung her 
wand and proclaimed the request fulfilled.  

Next, her mother requested for a cure for all ill 
children.  Again, with a sweep of the pinwheel, Sarah 
obliged.  

The mother, with a glance down at her rather ample 
curves, made her third wish, "I wish to have a trim 
figure again." 

The miniature fairy godmother started waving her wand 
madly. 

"I'll need more power for this!" she exclaimed. 

 

 

A tough old cowboy once counseled his grandson that if 
he wanted to live a long life, the secret was to sprinkle a 
little gunpowder on his oatmeal every morning. 

The grandson did this religiously and he lived to the age 
of 93.  

When he died, he left 14 children, 28 grandchildren, 35 
great grandchildren and a fifteen foot hole in the wall of 
the crematorium. 

 

 

"So, what's the matter?" asked one woman of her 
friend over coffee.  "I thought you just got back from a 
nice relaxing fishing trip with your husband." 

"Oh, everything went wrong," the second woman 
answered. 

"First, he said I talked so loud I would scare the fish. 

Then he said I was using the wrong bait; and then that I 
was reeling in too soon. 

"All that might have been all right; but to make matters 
worse, I ended up catching the most fish!" 

 

 

He was about to purchase the new car when he noticed 
the sign attached to the dashboard: “We put the ‘k’ in 
kwality.”   
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